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State of West Virginia
Solicitation Response
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VENDOR e
000000197400

STUART M PERRY INC

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE BUYER
Angela Mcorman

(304) 558-9427
angie.j.moorman@wv.gov

Signature X FEIN# DATE
All offers subject to all terms and conditions contained in this solicitation
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Line Comm Ln Desc Qty Unit Issue  Unit Price Ln Tota!l Or Contract Amount

1 STONE, AGGREGATE AND 0.00000 TON $0.000000 $0.00
CINDERS - MAT & DEL TO

Comm Code Manufacturer Specification Model #

11111600

Extended Description: |[STONE, AGGREGATE AND CINDERS - MAT & DEL TO NCN-EST LOCS
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State of West Virginia
Request For Quotation

Procurement Folder : 151811

Procurement Type : Agency Master Agreement

Document Description : STONE, AGGREGATE AND CINDERS - MAT & DEL TO NON-EST LOCS

Date Issued | Solicitation Closes Solicitation No

Version

13:00:00

2015-10-08 2015-11-10 ARFQ 0803 DOT1600000008

1

Phase
Finat

SUBMIT RESPONSES TO:

VENDOR

FINANCE & ADMINISTRATION

DIVISION OF HIGHWAYS

BLDG 5, RM A-220

1900 KANAWHA BLVD E :
CHARLESTON wv
us

25302

| Vendor Name, Address and ‘Teléphone

FOR INFORMATION CONTACT THE

Angela Moorman
(304) 558-9427
angie.j.moorman@wv.gov

Signature X # E ‘Wg}c' FENg oY -0SHIB6S

pate /Y739 45

Ali offers subject te all terms and conditions contalned in this solicitation

Date Printed : Oct 08, 2015 Soficitation Numbet ; DOT1600000008 Page: 1

FORM D : WV-PRC-ARFQ-001
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INVOICE TO SHIP TO
VARIOUS AGENCY LOCATIONS STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
AS INDICATED BY ORDER VARIOUS LOCATIONS AS INDICATED BY ORDER
No City Wv0999 No City WV 99999
us us
Line Commoedity Line Description Qty Unit Issue Unit Price Total Price
1 STONE, AGGREGATE AND 0.00C00 TON
CINDERS - MAT & DEL TO
Commodity Code Manufacturer Mode]| # Specification
11111600

Extended Description
STONE, AGGREGATE AND CINDERS - MAT & DEL TO NON-EST LOCS

| SCHEDULE OF EVENTS
Line Event Event Date
1 Techenical Question Due 2015-10-19

Date Printed : Oct 08, 2015 Solicitation Number: DOT1600000008 Page: 2 FORM ID : WV-PRC-ARFQ-001



Document Phase Document Description Page 3
DOT1600000008 Final STONE, AGGREGATE AND CINDERS - of 8
MAT & DEL TO NON-EST LOCS

GENERAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS:
{Agency Delegated Procurement Only)

. CONTRACTUAL AGREEMENT: Issuance of a Purchase Order signed by the Ageney, and approved as to form by the Atiomey General's
office if required, constitutes accepiance of this Contract made. by and between the State of West Virginia and the Vendor, Vendor's signature on
its bid signifies Vendor's agreement to be bound by and accept the terms and conditions contained in this Contract.

2. DEFINITIONS: As used in this Solicitation / Contract. the following terms shall have the meanings attributed to them below. Additional
definitions may be found in the specifications included with this Soticitation / Contract,

2.1 “Agency” means the agency, board, commission, or other cntity of the State of West Virginia that is identified on the first page of
the Solicitation.

2.2 “Contract” means the binding agreement that is entered into between the State and the Vendor {o provide the goods and services
requested in the Solicitation.

2.3 "Director” means the Director of the West Virginia [epartment of Administration. Purchasing Division.
2.4 “Purchasing Division™ means the West Virginia Department of Administration, Purchasing Division,

2.5 “Purchase Order™ means the documen signed by the Agency and the Purchasing Division, and approved as to form by the
Attorney General, that identifies the Vendor as the successful bidder and Contract holder. Notwithstanding the foregoing. the
Purchasing Division’s signature and approval by the Atiorney General's office as to form may not be required on a Purchase Order for
certain agency delegated purchases.

2.6 “Salicitation™ means the official solicitation issued by the Agency,
2.7 “S1ate” means the State of West Virginia and/or any of its agencies, commissions, boards, et¢. as conlexi requires.

2.8 “Vendor™ or “Vendors™ means any entity submitting a bid in response to the Solicitation, the entity that has been selecied as the
lowest responsible bidder, or the entity that has been awarded the Contract as context requires,

3. PRICING: The pricing set forth herein is firm for the life of the Contract, unless specified elsewhere within this Solicitation/Contract by the
State. A Vendor’s inclusion of price adjustment provisions in its bid, without an express authorization from the State in the Solicitation to do so,
may result in bid disqualification,

4. NOTICE TO PROCEED: The Vendor shall begin performance of this Contract immediately upon receiving notice to proceed. Unless
otherwise specified, the fully cxecuted Purchase Order will be cansidered notice to praceed.

5. EMERGENCY PURCHASES: The Purchasing Division Director may authorize the Agency to purchase goods or services in the open
market that Vendor would otherwise provide under this Contract if those 800ds or services are for immediate or expedited delivery in an
cmergency. Emergencies shall include, but are not limited to, delays in transportation or an unanticipated increase in the volume of work, An
emergency purchase in the open market, approved by the Purchasing Division Director, shall not constitute of breach of this Contract and shall
not entitle the Vendor to any form of compensation or damages. This provision does not excuse the State from fulfilling its obligations under a
One Time Purchase contract.

6. ALTERNATES: Any mode!, brand, or specification listed herein establishes the acceptable level of quality only and is not intended to reflect
a preference for, or in any way favor. a particular brand or vendor. Vendors may bid alternates to a listed model or brand provided that the
alternate is at least equal to the mode! or brand and complies with the required specifications. The equality of any altemate being bid shall be
determined by the State at its sole discretion, Any Vendor bidding an altemate model or brand should clearly identify the alternate items in its bid
and should include manufacturer’s specifications, industry literature, and/or any other relevant documentation demonstrating the equality of the
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alternate items. Failure to provide information for altemate ilems may be grounds for rejection of a Vendor's bid.

7. EXCEPTIONS AND CLARIFICATIONS: The Solicitation contzins the specifications that shall form the basis of a contractual agreement.
Vendor shall clearly mark any exceptions, clarifications, or other proposed modifications in its bid. Exceptions to, clarifications of. or
modifications of a requirement or term and condition of the Solicitation may result in bid disqualification,

8. ACCEPTANCE/REJECTION: The State may accept or Teject any bid in whole, or in part. Vendor's signature on its bid signifies acceptance
of the terms and conditions contained in the Solicitation and Vendor agrees 10 be bound by the terms of the Contract. as reflected in the Purchase
Order, upon receipt.

9. REGISTRATION: Prior to Contract award, the apparent successful Vendor must be properly registered with the West Virginia Purchasing
Division and must have paid the $125 fee if applicable.

10. FUNDING: This Comract shall continue for the term stated herein, contingent upon funds being appropriated by the Legistature or otherwise
being made available. In the event funds arc not appropriated or otherwise made available, this Contract becomes void and of no effect beginning
on July 1 of the fisca! year for which funding has not been appropriated or otherwise made available,

11, PAVMENT: Payment in advance is prohibited under this Contract, Payment may only be made afier the delivery and acceptance of goods or
services. The Vendor shall submit invoices, in arrears, 1o the Agency af the address on the face of the purchase order labeled “Invoice To.™

12. UNIT PRICE: Unit prices shall prevail in cases of a discrepancy in the Vender's bid.

13. DELIVERY: All quotations are considered freight on board destination (“F.Q.B. destination™} unless alternate shipping terms are clearly
identified in the bid, Vendor's listing of shipping terms that contradict the shipping terms expressly required by this Solicitation may result in bid
disqualification. ’

14. INTEREST: Interest attributable 10 late payment will only be permitied if authorized by the West Virginia Code. Presently, there is no
provision in the law for interest on late payments, .

15. PREFERENCE: Vendor Preference may only be granted upon written request and only in accordance with the West Virginia Code §
5A-3-37 and the West Virginia Code of State Rules. A Resident Vendor Certification form has been attached hereto to allow Vendor to apply for
the preference. Vendor's failure to submit the Resident Vendor Certification form with its bid will result in denial of Vendor Preference. Vendor
Preference does not apply 1o construction projects.

16, SMALL, WOMEN-OWNED, OR MINORITY-OWNED BUSINESSES:  For any selicitations pubticly advertised for bid on or after
July 1,2012, in accordance with West Virginia Code §5A-3- 3%a){7) and W. Va. CSR § 148-22-9, any non-resident vendor certified as a small,
women-owned, or minority-owned business under W. Va, CSR § 148-22-9 shall be provided the same preference made available to any resident
vendor.  Any non-resident small, women-owned, or minority-owned business must identify itself as such in writing, must submit that writing to
the Purchasing Division (or to the Agency handling the soficitation for agency delegated purchases) with its bid, and must be properly certified
under W, Va, CSR § 148-22-9 prior to submission of its bid to receive the preferences made available to resident vendors. Preference fora
non-resident small, women-owned, or minority-owned business shall be applied in accordance with W. Va. CSR § 148-22-9.

I7. TAXES: The Vendor shall pay any applicable sates, use, personal property or any other taxes arising out of this Contract and the transactions
sontemplated thercby. The State of West Virginia is exempt from federal and'state taxes and will not pay or reimburse such taxes.

18. CANCELLATION: The State reserves the right to cancel this Contract im mediately upon written notice to the vendor if the materials or
workmanship supplied do not conform to the specifications contained in the Contract, The Purchasing Diviston Director may cancel any
purchase or Contract upon 30 days written notice to the Vendor in accordance with West Virginia Code of State Rules § 148-1- 7.16.2.

19. WAIVER OF MINOR IRREGULARITIES: The Director reserves the right to waive minor irregularities in bids or specifications in
accordance with West Virginia Code of State Rules § 148-1-4.6.

[
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20. TIME: Time is of the essence with regard to all matters of time and performance in this Contract.

21, APPLICABLE £.AW: This Contract is governed by and inferpreted under West Virginia faw withoul giving effect to its choice of law
principles. Any information provided in specification manuals, or any other source, verbal or written, which contradicts or violates the West
Virginia Constitution, West Virginia Code or West Virginia Code of State Rules is void and of no effect.

22. COMPLIANCE: Vendor shall comply with ail applicable federal, state, and local laws, regulations and ordinances. By submitting a bid,
Vendors acknowledge that they have reviewed, understand, and wilk comply with all applicable law.

23, PREVAILING WAGE: On anv contract for the construction of a public improvement, Vendor and any subcontractors wtilized by Vendor
shall pay 2 rate or rates of wages which shall not be Jess than the fair minimum rate ot rates of wages {prevailing wage), as established by the
West Virginia Division of Labor under West Virginia Code §§ 21-5A-1 et seq. and available at
Mmmmmummmmmmm Vendor shall be responsible for ensuring compliance with prevailing
wage requirements and determining when prevailing wage requirements are applicable. The required contract provisions contained in West
Virginia Code of State Rules § 42-7-3 are specifically incorporated herein by reference.

24. ARBITRATION: Any references made to arbitration contained in this Contract, Vendor’s bid, or in any American Institute of Architects
dotuments pertaining to this Contract arc hereby deleted, void, and of no effect,

25. MODIFICATIONS: This writing is the partics” final expression of intent, Notwithstanding anything contained in this Contract to the
contrary. no modification of this Contract shall be binding without mutual written consent of the Ageney, and the Vendor, with approval of the
Purchasing Division and the Attorney General's office {Attorney General approval is as to form only). No Change shall be implemented by the
Vendor until such time as the Vendor receives an approved written change order from the Purchasing Division. Notwithstanding the foregoing,
Purchasing Division and Attorney General approval may or may nat be required on certain agency delegated or exempt purchases. In the event
that Purchasing Division approval is not required, change orders will be received from the Agency.

26. WAIVER: The failure of either party to insist upon a strict performance of any of the terms or provision of this Contract, or to exercise any
option, right. or remedy herein contained, shall not be construed as a waiver or 2 rel inquishment for the future of such term, provision, option,
right. or remedy, but the same shall continue in full force and effect. Any waiver must be expressly stated in writing and signed by the waiving

party.

27. SUBSEQUENT FORMS: The terms and conditions contained in this Contract shall supcrsede any and alil subsequent terms and conditions
which may appear on any form documents submitted by Vendor to the Agency or Purchasing Division such as price Hists, order forms, invoices,
sales agreements, or mainienance agreements, and includes internel websites or other electronic documents. Acceptance or use of Vendor’s forms
does not constitute acceptance of the terms and conditions contained thereon,

28. ASSIGNMENT: Neither this Contract nor any monies due, or to become due hereunder, may be assigned by the Vendor without the express
written consent of the Agency, the Purchasing Division, the Attomey General's office (as to form only), and any other government agency or
office that may be required to approve such assignmends. Notwithstanding the foregoing, Purchasing Division approval may or may not be
required on certain agency delegated or exempt purchases.

29. WARRANTY': The Vendor expressly warrants that the goods andfor services covered by this Contract will: (a) ¢conform to the
specifications, drawings, samples, or other description furnished or specified by the Agency: {b) be merchantable and fit for the purpose intended;
and (¢) be free from defect in material and workmanship,

30, STATE EMPLOYEES: State employees arc not permitted 1o utilize this Contract for personal use and the Vendor is prohibited from
permitting or facililating the same.

31. BANKRUPTCY: In the event the Vendor files for bankruptey protection, the State of West Virginia may deem this Contract null and void,
and terminate this Contraet without notice.

32. |RESERVED}|
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33. CONFIDENTIALITY: The Vendor agrees that it will not disclose to anvone, directly or indirectly, any such personally identifiable
information or other confidential information gained from the A gency, unless the individual who is the subject of the information consents to the
disclosure in writing or the disclosure is made pursuant to the Agency’s policies, procedures, and rules. Vendor further agrees to comply with the
Confidentiality Policies and [nformation Security Accountability Requirements, set forth in

hitp:ffwww state.wy usfadmin/purchase/privacy/default, him!,

34. DISCLOSURE: Vendor's response to the Solicitation and the resulting Contract are considered public documents and will be disclosed to
the public in accordance with the taws, rules, and policies governing the West Virginia Purchasing Division. Those laws include, but are not
limited to, the Freedom of Information Act found in West Virginia Code § 29B-1-1 et seq.

1fa Vendor considers any part of its bid to be exempt from public disclosure, Vendor must 5o indicate by specifically identifying the exempt
information, identifying the exemption that applies, providing a detiled justification for the exemption, segregating the cxempt information from
the general bid information, and submitting the exempt information as part of its bid but in a segregated and clearly identifiable format.  Failure
1o comply with the foregoing regquirements will result in public disclosure of the Vendor's bid withoul further notice. A Vendor's act of marking
all or nearly all of its bid as exempt is not sufficient to avoid disclosure and WILL NOT BE HONORED. Vendor's act of marking a bid or any
part thereof as “confidential” or “proprietary” is not sufficient 10 avoid disclosure and WILL NOT BE HONORED. in addition, a legend or other
statement indicating that all or substantiatly all of the bid is exempt from disclosure is not sufficient to avoid disclosure and WILL NOT BE
HONORED Vendor will be required to defend any claimed exemption for nondisclosure in the evem of an administrative or Jjudicial challenge to
the State’s nondisclosure. Vendor must indemnify the State for any costs incurred related to any exemptions claimed by Vendor. Any questions
rearding the applicability of the various public records Iaws shoutd be addressed to your own legal counsel prior to bid submission.

35. LICENSING: In accordance with West Virginia Code of State Rules §148-1-6.1.7, Vendor must be licensed and in good standing in
accordance with any and all state and local laws and requirements by any state or Jocal agency of West Virginia, including, but not limited to, the
West Virginia Secretary of State’s Office. the West Virginia Tax Department. West Virginia Insurance Commission, ar any other state agency or
potitical subdivision, Upon request, the Vendor must provide all necessary releases fo obtain information to enable the Purchasing Division
Director or the Agency to verify that the Vendor is licensed and in good standing with the above entities.

36. ANTITRUST: In submitting a bid to, signing a contract with, or accepting a Purchase Order from any agency of the Staie of West Virginia,
the Vendor agrees 1o convey, sell, assign, or transfer to the State of West Virginia alt rights, title, and interest in and to afl causes of action it may
now or hereafter acquite under the antitrust laws of the United States and the State of West Virginia for price fixing and/or unreasonable restraints
of trade relating to the particular commodities os services purchased or acquired by the State of West Virginia. Such assignment shall be made
and become effective at the time the purchasing agency tenders the initial payment to Vendor.

37. VENDOR CERTIFICATIONS: By signing its bid or entering into this Contract, Vendor certifies (1) that its bid was made without prior
understanding. agreement. ar connection with any corporation, firm, limited liability company, partnership, person or entity submitting a bid for
the same material, supplies, equipment or services; {2) that its bid is in all respects fair and without collusion or fraud. (3) that this Contract is
accepted or entered into without any prior understanding. agreement, or connection to any other entity that could be considered a violation of law;
and (4) that it has reviewed this RFQ in its entirety: understands the requirements, terms and conditions, and other information contained
herein. Vendor's signature on its bid also affirms that neither it nor its representatives have any interest, nor shall acquire any interest, direct or
indirect, which would compromise the performance of its services hereunder. Any such interests shall be promptly presented in detail to the
Agency.

The individual signing this bid on behalf of Vendor certiffes that he or she is authorized by the Vendor to execute this bid or any documents
related thereto on Vendor's behalf; that he or she is authorized to bind the Vendor in a contractual relationship; and that, to the best of his or her
knowledge. the Vendor has properly registered with any State agency that may requite registration.

38. PURCHASING CARD ACCEPTANCE: The State of West Virginia currently utilizes a Purchasing Card program, administered under
contract by a banking institution. to process payment for goods and services, The Vendor must accept the State of West Virginia’s Purchasing
Card for payment of all orders under this Contract.

39. VENDOR RELATIONSHIP: The relationship of the Vendor to the State shall be that of an independent contractor and no principal-agent


http://www.state.wv.us/admin/purchase/privacy/default.html.
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relationship or employer-employee relationship is coniemplated or created by this Contract. The Vendar as an independent contractor is solely
liable for the acts and omissions of its employees and agents. Vendor shall be responsible for selecting, supervising, and compensating any and all
individuals employed pursuant 1o the terms of this Solicitation and resulting contract. Neither the Vendor. nor any emplovees or subcontractors of
the Vendor, shall be deemed 10 be employees of the State for any purpose whatsoever. Vendor shall be exclusively responsible for payment of
employees and contractors for all wages and salaries, taxes, withholding payments, penalties, fecs, fringe benefits, professional liability insurance
premiums. contributions to insurance and pension, or other deferred compensation plans, including but not limited 1o, Workers" Com pensation
and Social Security obligations, licensing fees, etc. and the filing of all necessary documents, forms and returns pertinent 1o all of the foregoing.
Vendor shall hold harmiess the State, and shail provide the State and Agency with a defense against any and all claims including, but not limited
1o, the foregoing payments, withholdings, contributions, taxes, Social Security laxes, and employer income tax retums.

40. INDEMNIFICATION: The Vendor agrees o indemnify, defend, and hold harmless the State and the Agency, their officers, and employees
from and against: ( 1) Any claims or Josses for services rendered by any subcontractor, person, or firm performing or supplying services,
materials, or supplics in connection with the performance of the Cantract, (2) Any claims or losses resulting to any person or entity injured or
damaged by the Vendor, its officers, employees, or subcontractors by the publication, translation, reproduction, delivery, performance, use, or
disposition of any data used under the Contract in a manner not authorized by the Contract, or by Federal or State statutes or regulations; and {3)
Any failure of the Vendor, its ofticers, emplayees, or subcontractors to observe State and Federal lawws including, but not limited to, Iabor and
wage and hour laws.

41. PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT: In accordance with West Virginia Code § 5A-3-10a, all Vendors are required to sign, notarize, and submit
the Purchasing Affidavit stating that neither the Vendor nor a related party owe a debt 1o the State in excess of $1.000. The affidavit must be
submitted prior to award, but should be submitted with the Vendor’s bid. A copy of the Purchasing Affidavit is inciuded herewith.

42, CONFLICT OF INTEREST: Vendor, its officers or members or employees, shall not presently have or acquire any interest, direct or
indirect, which would conflict with or compromise the performance of its obl igations hereunder. Vendor shall periodically inquire of its officers,
members and employees to ensure that a conflict of interest docs not arise. Any conflict of interest discovered shall be promptly presented in
detail to the Agency.

43. BACKGROUND CHECK: In accordance with W, Va, Code § 15-2D-3, the Director of the Division of Protective Services shall require any
service provider whose employees are regularly employed on the grounds or in the buildings of the Capitol complex or who have access to
sensitive or critical information to submil to a fingerprini-based state and federal background inquiry through the state repository, The service
provider is responsible for any costs associated with the fingerprint-based state and federal background inquiry

After the contract for such services has been approved, bw: before any such employees are permitted 10 be on the grounds or in the buiidings of
the Capitof complex or have access to sensitive or critical information, the service provider shall submit a list of all persons who will be
physically present and working at the Capitol complex to the Director of the Division of Protective Services for purposes of verifying complidnce
with this provision. :

The State rescrves the right to prohibit a service provider’s employees from accessing sensitive or critical information or to be present at the
Capitol complex based upon results addressed from a criminal background check.

Service providers should contact the West Virginia Division of Protective Services by phone at (304) 558-9911 for more information.

44. PREFERENCE FOR USE OF DOMESTIC STEEL PRODUCTS: Except when authorized by the Director of the Purchasing Division
pursuant to W, Va. Code § 5A-3-56. no contractor may use or supply steel products for a State Contract Project other than those stecl products
made in the United Stafes. A contractor who uses steel products in violation of this section may be subject to civil penalties pursuant to W, Va,
Code § 5A-3-56. As used in this section:

a. "State Contract Project” means any erection or construction of, or any addition to, alteration of or other improvemem to any

building or structure. including, but not limited {0, roads or highways. or the installation of any heating or cosl ing or ventilating plants ¢
or other equipment, or the supply of and materials for such projects, pursvant fo a contract with the State of West Virginia for which
bids were solicited on or after June 6. 2001,
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b. “Steel Products” means products rolled, formed, shaped, drawn, extruded, forged, cast. fabricated or otherwise similarly processed,
or processed by a combination of two or more or such operations, from steel made by the open heath, basic oxygen, clectric furnace,
Bessemer or other steel making process.

The Purchasing Division Director may, in writing, authorize the use of foreign steel products it

a The cost for each contract item used does not exceed one tenth of one pereent (.1%) of the Lotal coniract cost or two thousand five
hundred doHars ($2.500.00). whichever is greater, For the purposes of this section, the cost is the value of the steel product as
delivered to the praject; or

b. The Director of the Purchasing Division determines thal specified stee) materials are not produced in the United Siates in sufficient
quantity or otherwise arc not reasonably available to meet contract requirements.

45. PREFERENCE FOR USE OF DOMESTIC ALUMENUM, GLASS, AND STEEL: In Accordance with W. Va_ Code § 5-19-1 et seq.,
and W. Va. CSR § [48-10-1 et seq., for every contract or subcontract, subject to the limitations contained herein, for the construction,
reconstruction, alteration, repair, improvement or maintenance of public works or for the purchase of any item of machinery or equipment to be
used at sites of pubtic works, only domestic aluminum, glass or steel products shall be supplied unless the spending officer determines, in writing,
aficr the receipt of offers or bids. (1) that the cost of domesti¢ aluminum, glass or sieel products is unreasonable or inconsistent with the public
Interest of the State of West Virginia. {2) that domestic aluminum, glass or stee! products are not produced in sufficient quantities to meet the
contract requirements, or (3) the available domestic aluminum, glass, or steel do not meet the contract specifications. This provision only applies
10 public works contracts awarded in an amount more than fifty thousand dollars $50,000) or public works contracts that require more than ten
thousand pounds of steel products.

The cost of domestic aluminum, glass, or steel products may he unreasonable if the cost is more than twenty: percent (20%) of the bid or offered
price for foreign made aluminum, giass, or steel products. If the domestic aluminum, glass or steel products to be supplied or produced in a
“substantial labor surplus area”, as defined by the United States Department of Labor, the cost of domestic aluminum, glass, or steel products may
be unreasonable if the cost is more than thirty pereent (30%) of the bid or offered price for foreign made aluminum. glass, or steef products.

This preference shall be applicd to an item of machinery or equipment, as indicated above, when the item is a single unit of equipment or
machinery manufactured primarily of aluminum, glass or stecl, is part of a public works contract 2nd has the sole purpose or of beéing a permanent
part of a single public works project. This provision does not apply to equipment or machinery purchased by a spending unit for use by that
spending unit and not as part of a single public works project.

All bids and offers including domestic aluminum, glass or steed products that exceed bid or offer prices including foreign aluminum, glass or stee!
products after application of the preferences provided in this provision may be reduced to a price equal to or lower than the lowest bid or offer
price for foreign aluminum, glass or steel products plus the applicable preference. If the reduced bid or offer prices are made in writing and
supersede the prior bid or offer prices, all bids or offers, including the reduced bid or offer prices, will be reevaluated in accordance with this rule.



INFORMATION ATTACHMENT
Vendor's Storage Sites
2015/2016 Stone and Aggregate - Materials and Delivery by Vendor to Non-Established WVDOH Locations

VENDOR NAME Stuart M. Perry, inc.

Mandatory - Vendor shall complete this form and return with bid submission.

A Vendor may submit more than one Vendor's Storage Sites information on one Information Attachment form
ONLY if bid pricing is the SAME for all Storage Sites and all WVDOH locations bid. A separate bid submission

and Information Attachment form MUST be submitted when bid price varies between Vendor's Storage Sites.

Limestone, Sandstone, Gravel, Sand, Blast Furnance Slag and Steel Slag

a) SOURCE OF MATERIAL (all sources for which bid prices apply {e.g., Quarry location if Sandstone
or Limestone; dredging or pit location if Gravel; production plant name and location if Slag)

Stuart M. Perry, Inc. - Winchester Quarry
117 Limestone Lane

Winchester, VA 22602

540-662-3431

b) EXACT LOCATION OF VENDOR'S STORAGE SITE(S): A separate bid schedule
must be submitted when bid price varies between Vendors' storage sites.

Stuart M. Perry, Inc. - Winchester Quarry
117 Limestone Lane

Winchester, VA 22602

540-662-3431 '

Cinders

¢} SOURCE OF MATERIAL: Name and Location of plant which produces Cinder material.

d) EXACT LOCATION OF VENDOR'S STORAGE SITE(S) A separate bid schedule
must be submitted when bid price varies between Vendors' storage sites.




Pricing Page VENDOR NAME Stuart M. Perry, Inc. - Winchester

Material and delivery by the Vendor to Non-Established WVDOH locations, ONLY.

Bid Price per Ton Items A-W and AA
F.O.B. Vendor's Storage Site
Limestone,
Contract | Sandstone, | Blast Furnace
Item Description of Material Gravel, Sand Slag Steel Slag
A Class 1 Aggregate 9.60
B Class 2 Aggregate ‘ 9.60
C Class 10 Aggregate 9.60
D AASHTO #1 Aggrepate no bid
E AASHTO #3 Aggregate 10.44
F AASHTO #4 Aggregate no bid
G AASHTO #467 Aggregate no bid
H AASHTO #57 Aggregate 11.75
1 AASHTO #67 Aggregate ' no bid
J AASHTO #7 Aggregate 11.85
K AASHTO #8 Aggregate 12.00
L AASHTO #9 Aggregate 14.00
M Stone for Gabions 12.39
N Fine Aggregate 13.42
QA  |[Limestone Standard Abrasives 11.61
OB  |Sandstone Standard Abrasives no bid
PA  |Limestone Modified Abrasives 11.61
PB Sandstone Modified Abrasives no bid
Q Rip Rap no bid
R Shot Rock no bid
S AASHTO #8 Modified ) 12.00
T AASHTO #9 Modified 14.00
U Pea Gravel no bid
\% #11 Limestone Abrasives 13.42
W Quarry Waste 7.75
AA  |Cinders | | nobid |
Items A-W and AA (Except for Q and R):
X1 [Haul by Vendor - First Ton-Mile 1.95
X2 Haul by Vendor - Additional Ton-Mile 0.55
Items @ and R ONLY:
Y1 Haul by Vendor - First Ton-Mile no bid
Y2 Haul by Vendor - Additional Ton-Mile no bid




STATE OF WEST VIRGINIA
Purchasing Division

PURCHASING AFFIDAVIT

MANDATE: Under W. Va. Code §5A-3-10a, no contract or renewal of any contract may be awarded by the state or any
of its political subdivisions to any vendor or prospective vendor when the vendor or prospective vendor or a related party
to the vendor or prospective vendor is a debtor and: (1) the debt owed is an amount greater than one thousand dollars in
the aggregate; or {2) the debtor is in employer default,

EXCEPTION: The prohibition listed above does not apply where a vendor has contested any tax administered pursuant to
chapter eleven of the W. Va. Code, workers’ compensation premium, permit fee or environmental fee or assessment and
the matter has not become final or where the vendor has entered into a payment plan or agreement and the vendor is not
in default of any of the provisions of such plan or agreement.

DEFINITIONS:

“Debt” means any assessment, premium, penalty, fine, tax or other amount of money owed to the state or any of its
political subdivisions because of a judgment, fine, permit violation, license assessment, defaulted workers’
compensation premium, penalty or other assessment presently delinquent or due and required to be paid to the state
orany of its political subdivisions, including any interest or additional penalties accrued thereon.

“Employer default” means having an outstanding balance or liability to the old fund or to the uninsured employers’
fund or being in policy default, as defined in W. Va. Code § 23-2¢-2, failure to maintain mandatory workers®
compensation coverage, or failure to fully meet its obligations as a workers' compensation self-insured employer. An
employer is not in emptoyer default if it has entered into a repayment agreement with the Insurance Commissioner
and remains in compliance with the obligations under the repayment agreement.

“Related party” means a party, whether an individual, corporation, partnership, association, limited iiability company
or any other form or business association or other entity whatsoever, related to any vendor by blood, marriage,
ownership or contract through which the party has a refationship of ownership or other interest with the vendor so that
the party will actually or by effect receive or control a portion of the benefit, profit or other consideration from
performance of a vendor contract with the party receiving an amount that meets or exceed five percent of the total
contract amount.

AFFIRMATION: By signing this form, the vendor’s authorized signer affirms and acknowledges under penalty of
law for false swearing (W. Va. Code §61-5-3) that neither vendor nor any related party owe a debt as defined
above and that neither vendor nor any related party are in employer default as defined above, unless the debt or
employer default is permitted under the exception above.

WITNESS THE FOLLOWING SIGNATURE:
Vendor's Name: Stuart M. PerrY! Inc.

Authorized Signature:;%’(l, W’ Qgcm«/./ Date: Oct 30, 2015

State of Virginia

County of Frederick . to-wit:

Taken, subscribed, and sworn to before me this Eﬁ day of OCtOber 30 , 201_5_.
! i - 29N i

My Commission expires A; W&Jb&( =0, , 20 Lb_

‘ )@ twtf
AFFIX SEAL HERE noTARY pusLICY.) (A CKL/ é mzmi/’

Purchasing Affidavit (Revised 08/01/2015)

firdie E. Cantrati
NOTARY PUBLIC
Commonwealth of Virginis
Reg. # 138725 .
My Commission Expires Nov. 30, 201




wao State of West Virginia
sars o VENDOR PREFERENCE CERTIFICATE

Certification and application is hereby made for Preference in accordance with West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37. (Does not apply to
construction contracts). West Virginia Code, §5A-3-37, provides an opportunity for qualifying vendors to request {at the time of bid)
preference for their residency status. Such preference is an evaluation method only and will be applied only to the cost bid in
accordance with the West Virginia Code. This certificate for application is to be used to request such preference. The Purchasing
Division will make the determination of the Vendor Preference, if applicable.

f Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder s an individual resident vendor and has resided continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preced-
ing the date of this certification; or,
[:I Bidder is a partnership, association or corporation resident vendor and has maintained its headquarters or principal place of
business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or 80% of the
ownership interest of Bidder is held by another individual, partnership, association or corporation resident vendor who has
maintained its headquarnters or principal place of business continuously in West Virginia for four (4) years immediately
preceding the date of this certification; or,
Bidder is a nonresident vendor which has an affiliate or subsidiary which employs a minimum of one hundred state residents
and which has maintained its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia continuously for the four (4)
years immediately preceding the date of this certification; or,

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who certifies that, during the fife of the contract, on average at least 75% of the employees
working on the project being bid are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state continuously for the two years
immediately preceding submission of this bid; or,

Application is made for 2.5% vendor preference for the reason checked:

Bidder is a nonresident vendor employing a minimum of one hundred state residents or is a nonresident vendor with an
affiliate or subsidiary which maintains its headquarters or principal place of business within West Virginia employing a
minimum of one hundred state residents who certifies that, during the life of the contract, on average at least 75% of the
employees or Bidder's affiliate’s or subsidiary’s employees are residents of West Virginia who have resided in the state
continuously for the two years immediately preceding submission of this bid: or,

Appiication is made for 5% vendor preference for the reason checked:
Bidder meets either the requirement of both subdivisions (1) and {2) or subdivision {1) and (3) as stated above; or,

Application is made for 3.5% vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is anindividual resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves orthe National Guard
and has resided in West Virginia continuously for the four years immediately preceding the date on which the bid is
submitted; or,

Application is made for 3.5% vendor preference who is a veteran for the reason checked:

Bidder is a resident vendor who is a veteran of the United States armed forces, the reserves or the National Guard, if, for
purposes of producing or distributing the commaodities or completing the project which is the subject of the vendor's bid and
continuously over the entire term of the project, on average at least seventy-five percent of the vendor's employees are
residents of West Virginia whao have resided in the state continuously for the two immediately preceding years.

Application is made for preference as a non-resident smalf, women- and minority-owned business, in accor-
dance with West Virginia Code §5A-3-59 and West Virginia Code of State Rules.

Bidder has been or expects to be approved prior to contract award by the Purchasing Division as a certified smail, women-
and minority-owned business.

Bidder understands if the Secretary of Revenue determines that a Bidder receiving preference has failed to continue to meet the
requirements for such preference, the Secretary may order the Director of Purchasing to: (a) reject the bid; or (b) assess a penalty
against such Bidder in an amount not to exceed 5% of the bid amount and that such penalty will be paid to the contracting agency
or deducted from any unpaid balance on the contract or purchase order.

By submission of this certificate, Bidder agrees to disclose any reasonably requested infermation to the Purchasing Division and
authorizes the Department of Revenue to disclose to the Director of Pu rchasing appropriate information verifying that Bidder has paid
the required business taxes, provided that such information does not contain the amounts of taxes paid nor any other information
deemed by the Tax Commissioner to be confidential.

Under penalty of law for false swearing (West Virginia Code, §61 -5-3}, Bidder hereby certifies that this certificate is true
and accurate in all respects; and that if a contract is issued 1o Bidder and if anything contained within this certificate
changes during the term of the contract, Bidder will notify the Purchagi g Di isim:i?g immediately.

Bidder: Stuart M. Perry, Inc. Signed: . ff;'/
' N !

0 O

[ DP

Dsn

N

Date: October 30, 2015 Title; Secretary




ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS (Construction Contracts Ounly)

1. CONTRACTOR’S LICENSE: West Virginia Code § 21-11-2 requires that all persons
desiring to perform contracting work in this state be licensed. The West Virginia Contractors
Licensing Board is empowered to issue the contractor’s license. Applications for a
contractor’s license may be made by contacting the West Virginia Division of Labor. West
Virginia Code § 21-11-11 requires any prospective Vendor to include the contractor’s license
number on its bid. Failure to include a contractor’s license number on the bid shall result in
Vendor’s bid being disqualified. Vendors should include a contractor’s license number in the
space provided below. '

s M AP |
Contractor’s Name:_ca>TUART" Enang [
Contractor’s License No. YN O\3 AN

The apparent successful Vendor must furnish a copy of its contractor’s license prior to the
issnance of a Award Document.

2. DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE AFFIDAVIT: W. Va. Code § 21-1D-5 provides that any
solicitation for a public improvement contract requires each Vendor that submits a bid for the
work to submit at the same time an affidavit that the Vendor has a written plan for a drug-
free workplace policy. To comply with this law, Vendor must either complete the enclosed
drug-free workplace affidavit and submit the same with its bid or complete a similar affidavit
that fuifills all of the requirements of the applicable code. Failure to submit the signed and
notarized drug-free workplace affidavit or a similar affidavit that fully complies with the
requirements of the applicable code, with the bid shall result in disqualification of Vendor’s
bid. Pursuant to W. Va. Code 21-1D-2(b) and (k), this provision does not apply to public
improvement contracts the value of which is $100,000 or less or temporary or emergency
repairs.

2.1. DRUG-FREE WORKPLACE POLJICY: Pursuant to W. Va. Code § 21-1D-4,
Vendor and its subcontractors must implement and maintain a written drug-free
workplace policy that complies with said article. The awarding public authority
shall cancel this contract if: (1) Vendor fails to implement and maintain a written
drug-free workplace policy described in the preceding paragraph, (2) Vendor fails
to provide information regarding implementation of its drug-free workplace
policy at the request of the public authority; or (3) Vendor provides to the public
authority false information regarding the contractor's drug-free workplace policy.
Pursuant to W. Va. Code 21-1D-2(b) and (k), this provision does not apply to
public improvement contracts the value of which is $100,000 or less or temporary
or emergency repairs.

3. DRUG FREE WORKPLACE REPORT: Pursuant to W. Va. Code § 21-1D-7b, no less
than once per year, or upon completion of the project, every contractor shall provide a
certified report to the public authority which let the contract. For contracts over $25,000, the

Revised 08/01/2015



CERTIFICATIONAND SIGNATURE PAGE

By signing below, or submitting documentation through wvOASIS, I certify that I have reviewed
this Solicitation in its entirety; understand the requirements, terms and conditions, and other
information contained herein; that [ am submitting this bid, offer or proposal for review and
consideration; that I am authorized by the vendor to execute and submit this bid, offer, or
proposal, or any documents related thereto on vendor’s behalf; that 1 am authorized to bind the
vendor in a contractual relationship; and that to the best of my knowledge. the vendor has
properly registered with any State agency that may require registration,

1\}—-;-\| Laad E‘Y\/\-f

’%{J /;% Scw wawgwrﬂﬁ

(Authorized Signhture) (Representative Name, Title)

SWo-bL1-294Yy s4a111-R2TY 1v-3a -1y
(Phone Number) (Fax Number) (Date)

Revised 08/01/2015



ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGEMENT FORM
SOLICITATION NO.: DU 1 'ToUUVUULUS

Instructions:  Please acknowledge reccipt of all addenda issued with this solicitation by
completing this addendum acknowledgment form. Check the box next to each addendum
received and sign below. Failure to acknowledge addenda may result in bid disqualification.

Acknowledgment: [ hereby acknowledge receipt of the following addenda and have made the

necessary revisions to my proposal, plans and/or specification, etc.

Addendum Numbers Received:
(Check the box next to each addendum received)

{ ] AddendumNo.1 ] Addendum No. 6
[ ] AddendumNo.2 D Addendum No. 7
D Addendum No. 3 D Addendum No. 8§
D Addendum No. 4 [D Addendum No. 9
D Addendum No. 5 D Addendum No. 10

I understand that failure to confirm the receipt of addenda may be cause for rejection of this bid.
I further understand that any verbal representation made or assumed to be made during any oral
discussion held between Vendor’s representatives and any state personnel is not binding. Only
the information issued in writing and added to the specifications by an official addendum is
binding.

ngua—mr M ' ‘TQ'\‘""V /A)c
Company , .
v

Autf{orized Signatur

/0 ~30-1%
Date

NOTE: This addendum acknowledgement should be submitted with the bid to expedite
document processing.

Revised 08/01/2015
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